
BID #11G04 - VINYL & REFLECTIVE ROLL MATERIAL FOR SIGN MAKING MACHINE, MAC TAC OR EQUAL

Beacon Graphics

dba Vector Graphics Osburn Associates Inc. Custom Products Corp 3M

1. Engineer grade, reflective pressure sensitive

  Manufacturer 3M Nikkalite 8100P Series 3M Series 3290

24"x 50 yards model# model# model#  model#  

    Yellow no bid $198.00 $228.00 $265.20 3271

    Red no bid $198.00 $228.00 $265.20 3272

    Blue no bid $198.00 $228.00 $265.20 3275

    Green no bid $198.00 $228.00 $265.20 3277

    Brown no bid $198.00 $228.00 $265.20 3279

    White no bid $198.00 $228.00 $265.20 3290

 Manufacturer 3M Nikkalite 8100P Series 3M Series 3290

30"x 50 yards model# model# model#  model#  

    Yellow no bid $247.00 $285.00 $331.50 3271

    Red no bid $247.00 $285.00 $331.50 3272

    Blue no bid $247.00 $285.00 $331.50 3275

    Green no bid $247.00 $285.00 $331.50 3277

    Brown no bid $247.00 $285.00 $331.50 3279

    White no bid $247.00 $285.00 $331.50 3290

2.  Vinyl equal to MacTac High Performance 9800 series

Manufacturer Vector 3M 7725 Avery A9 vinyl 3M Series 7725 & 180C

24" x 50 yards model# model# model#  model#  

    Deep Red 177.75$  V1099*arrest me red $285.00 $266.82 $307.92 180C-23

    Vivid Blue 136.60$  PV710 2 rl min $285.00 $266.82 $259.89 7725-17

    Dark Green 136.60$  PV717*forest 2 rl min $285.00 $266.82 $259.89 7725-56

    Olympic Blue 177.75$  V1016 $285.00 $266.82 $259.89 7725-57

    Peacock Blue 177.75$  V1015 $285.00 $266.82 no bid

    Bright Yellow 136.60$  PV722 2 rl min $285.00 $266.82 $259.89 7725-15

    Cardinal Red 136.60$  PV739 2 rl min $285.00 $266.82 $259.89 7725-53

    Black Gloss 113.60$  PV702 $285.00 $232.59 $223.68 7725-12

    White Gloss 113.60$  PV701 $285.00 $232.59 $223.68 7725-10

    Russet Brown 171.17$  V1036*mahogony 2 rl min $285.00 $266.82 $259.89 7725-29



BID #11G04 - VINYL & REFLECTIVE ROLL MATERIAL FOR SIGN MAKING MACHINE, MAC TAC OR EQUAL

Beacon Graphics 

dba Vector Graphics Osburn Associates Inc. Custom Products Corp 3M

2.  Vinyl equal to MacTac High Performance 9800 series (con't.)

Manufacturer Vector 3M 7725 Avery A9 vinyl 3M Series 7725 & 180C

30" x 50 yards model# model# model#  

    Deep Red 237.00$  V1099*arrest me red $356.00 no bid $423.38 180C-23

    Vivid Blue 182.20$  PV710 $356.00 no bid $324.86 7725-17

    Dark Green 182.20$  PV717*forest $356.00 no bid $324.86 7725-56

    Olympic Blue 237.00$  V1016 $356.00 no bid $324.86 7725-57

    Peacock Blue 237.00$  V1015 $356.00 no bid no bid

    Bright Yellow 182.20$  PV722 $356.00 no bid $324.86 7725-15

    Cardinal Red 182.20$  PV739 $356.00 no bid $324.86 7725-53

    Black Gloss 141.95$  PV702 $356.00 $290.74 $279.60 7725-12

    White Gloss 141.95$  PV701 $356.00 $290.74 $279.60 7725-29

Manufacturer 7725-12 white/blk only 3M Series 7725 & 180C

Transparent Vinyl

    18" x 50 yards 113.60$  PV703 $225.00 $210.79 $184.52 7725-114

    24" x 50 yards 113.60$  PV703 $300.00 $255.49 $223.68 7725-114

    30" x 50 yards 141.95$  PV703 $375.00 $319.37 $279.60 7725-114

3.  Other Materials

Manufacturer Vector 3M 3M 3M 1177,4081 &1150

Green Trans. Film 15"x50 yards 244.13$  $196.00 $217.67 3M 1170 258.75$     

Green Trans. Film 24"x50 yards 389.34$  $315.00 $348.28 3M 1170 414.00$     

DG3 Fluorescent Yellow 24'x50 yards no bid $1,290.00 $1,401.00 3M 1,224.00$  

DG3 Fluorescent Yellow 30"x50 yards no bid $1,620.00 $1,751.25 3M 1,530.00$  

Overlay Film no bid $525.00 $465.00 3M 1150 Overlay 483.75$     


