

BID # 11G50 - LUBRICANTS

| | Bi-Lo | Circle Lubricants | Lubenet LLC | David Weber |
|-----------------------------|----------|-------------------|-------------|-------------|
| 1. Engine Oil 5W30 | | | | |
| Mfg. | Cam2 | Service Pro | Lubenet | Gibraltar |
| 55 gallon unit price | \$439.45 | \$394.35 | \$369.00 | \$409.20 |
| 2. HD Engine Oil 30 | | | | |
| Mfg. | Cam2 | Service Pro | | Gibraltar |
| 55 gallon unit price | \$449.95 | \$399.30 | no bid | \$382.25 |
| 3. HD Engine Oil 40 | | | | |
| Mfg. | Cam2 | Service Pro | | Gibraltar |
| 55 gallon unit price | \$459.95 | \$425.15 | no bid | \$382.25 |
| 4. Motor Oil SAE 15W40 | | | | |
| Mfg. | Cam2 | Service Pro | | Gibraltar |
| 55 gallon unit price | \$449.95 | \$445.50 | no bid | \$436.70 |
| 5. Gear Oil 85-140 | | | | |
| Mfg. | Citgo | Service Pro | Penzoil | Gibraltar |
| 120 lb. unit price | \$229.95 | \$178.00 | \$170.00 | \$158.40 |
| 6. Transmission Oil T-4 10W | | | | |
| Mfg. | Coastal | 76 Lubricants | | Gibraltar |
| 55 gallon unit price | \$579.95 | \$549.95 | no bid | \$465.30 |
| 7. Transmission Oil T-4 30 | | | | |
| Mfg. | Coastal | 76 Lubricants | | Gibraltar |
| 55 gallon unit price | \$579.95 | \$549.95 | no bid | \$491.70 |

BID # 11G50 - LUBRICANTS

| | | | | |
|----------------------|----------|-------------|----------|-----------|
| 8. Hydraulic Oil 10W | | | | |
| Mfg. | Cam2 | Service Pro | Lubenet | Gibraltar |
| 55 gallon unit price | \$349.95 | \$317.35 | \$385.00 | \$315.70 |
| 9. Kerosene | | | | |
| Mfg. | | | | Gibraltar |
| unit price | \$299.95 | no bid | no bid | \$343.20 |

BID # 11G50 - LUBRICANTS

10. Automatic Transmission

Oil/Fluid (red)

Mfg.

unit price

| | | | |
|----------|----------------------|-----------------|-----------|
| \$379.95 | Service Pro | Lubenet | Gibraltar |
| | \$391.60 55 gal | \$385.00 55 gal | \$409.20 |
| | Service Pro Complete | Quakerstate | |
| | \$514.80 | \$485.00 55 gal | |