

BID #15G06 - PRINTING, LETTERHEAD, ENVELOPES, RECEIPTS, ETC.

		<u>W.B. Mason</u>	<u>Village Office Supply</u>	<u>Phoenix Bus Prods</u>	<u>Gallery Digital</u>	<u>Lorraine Gregory Corp.</u>	<u>Postal Env. Co.</u>
1a. Letterhead - 8 1/2" x 11"							
Blue or black ink	per 1000	\$72.00	\$168.84	\$46.50	no bid	no bid	\$90.00
Green	per 1000	\$72.00	\$120.60	\$46.50	no bid	no bid	\$100.00
<u>ENVELOPES</u>							
1b. 4 1/8" x 9 1/2" No. 10 Window	per 1000	\$58.00	\$61.64	\$30.00	no bid	\$80.91	\$73.00
1c. 4 1/8" x 9 1/2" White wove bond	per 1000	\$58.00	\$59.96	\$29.00	\$40.00	\$77.16	\$71.00
1d. 4 1/8" x 9 1/2" window 4/12" x 1 1/8" positioned 7/8" from right and 1/2" from bottom	per 1000	\$68.00	\$57.32	\$30.00	no bid	\$81.93	\$75.00
1e. 4 1/2" x 9 1/2" 24 lb white woven self addressed return envelope - Town Clerk	per 1000	no bid	\$59.96	\$29.00	no bid	\$77.16	\$71.00
1f. 3 5/8" x 6 1/2" window 1 1/4" x 4 1/2" positioned 7/8" from left side and 1/2" from bottom-tax receiver	per 1000	\$58.00	\$85.00	\$29.00	no bid	\$142.19	\$77.00
1g. 3 7/8" x 8 7/8" 24 lb white woven self addressed, bar coded (Comm1 Garbage)	per 1000	\$52.00	\$55.56	\$32.00	no bid	\$77.16	\$71.00
1h. 9 1/2" x 12 1/2" Gray Kraft stock, gummed flap self-addressed return envelope	per 500	\$365.00	no bid	\$125.00	no bid	no bid	\$842.00
1i. 9" x 12" Kraft stock, gum flap, printing on side (plumbing) (plumbing)	per 2000	\$274.00	\$136.68	\$175.00	no bid	\$271.48	\$284.00
1j. 10" x 15" Kraft stock, gummed flap, printing two sides (building permit folder)	per 2000	\$645.00	\$186.26	\$232.00	no bid	\$465.53	\$467.00
1k. 10" x 15" Kraft stok, gummed flap, printing one side (sign permit folder)	per 2000	\$370.00	\$178.22	\$200.00	no bid	\$367.64	\$367.00
1l. 10" x 15" Kraft stock, gummed flap, printing one side (Zoning Board of Appeals)	per 2000	\$370.00	\$178.22	\$200.00	no bid	\$367.64	\$367.00
1m. 10" x 15" Kraft Stock, gummed flap, printing one side (rental/accessory apt. review board)	per 2000	\$640.00	\$186.26	\$232.00	no bid	\$465.53	\$467.00
1n. 4 1/8" x 9 1/2" No. 10 Window, Sub.24 - green ink (green homes)	per 1000	\$60.00	\$81.74	\$30.00	no bid	\$95.97	\$88.00
1o. 3 7/8" x 8 7/8" white woven, self addressed return envelope incl bar code - green ink (green homes)	per 1000	\$58.00	\$91.00	\$32.00	no bid	\$92.22	\$86.00
1p. 9 1/2" x 12 1/2" Gray Kraft stock, gummed flap Town Clerk in return address	per 2500	\$715.00	no bid	\$300.00	no bid	no bid	no bid

BID #15G06 - PRINTING, LETTERHEAD, ENVELOPES, RECEIPTS, ETC.

		<u>W.B. Mason</u>	<u>Village Office Supply</u>	<u>Phoenix Bus Prods</u>	<u>Gallery Digital</u>	<u>Lorraine Gregory Corp.</u>	<u>Postal Env. Co.</u>	
<u>CARDS & TICKETS</u>								
Business Cards:								
2a.	2" x 3 1/2" White card stock	per 1000	\$16.50	\$20.00	\$25.00	\$40.00	no bid	no bid
2b.	2" x 3 1/2" white card stock printed 2 sides	per 1000	\$18.50	\$25.00	\$40.00	\$55.00	no bid	no bid
Tickets								
2c.	2" x 3 7/8" rounded corners, blue stock (Sr. Citizens)	per 500	\$95.00	\$194.30	\$50.00	no bid	no bid	no bid
Directory cards								
2d.	4" x 9" white 110 lb Index Card Stock, 2-sided-Supervi	per 1000	\$110.00	\$221.10	\$55.00	\$105.00	no bid	no bid
<u>CERTIFICATES & PROCLAMATIONS</u>								
<u>Achievement, Community Service Awards</u>								
3a.	8 3/8" x 10 7/8" GOES Form 3522, black ink green border (Town Council)	per 1000	\$280.00	\$120.60	\$190.00	no bid	no bid	no bid
3b.	8 3/8" x 10 7/8" GOES Form 34605, black ink red border (Town Council)	per 1000	\$280.00	\$120.60	\$190.00	no bid	no bid	no bid
<u>RECEIPT BOOKS & NCR SETS</u>								
<u>Town Clerk Receipt Book</u>								
4a.	Receipt 2 12" x 6" - Book 12 1/2" H x 7" W, NCR 2 part, 5 perforated receipts to page. 1 page stationary. Color choice 250 receipts per book. Consecutively numbered,wrap around with additional cover w/printed title & book number	per 40	no bid	no bid	\$550.00	no bid	no bid	no bid
<u>Ordinance Enforcement Summons book</u>								
4b.	6 1/2" x 9 1/2" 3 page NCR, white,yellow,pink perforated at top, consecutively numbered 50 sets per book	per 40	\$275.00	\$157.75	\$150.00	no bid	no bid	no bid
<u>Second Kitchen Removal Form</u>								
4c.	8 1/2" x 11" 3 page NCR, white,yellow,pink (Planning)	per 1000	\$185.00	\$220.15	\$150.00	\$145.00	no bid	no bid
<u>Rental Inspection Checklist</u>								
4d.	8 1/2" x 11" 2 page NCR sets, white, pink	per 1000	\$185.00	\$135.40	\$100.00	\$110.00	no bid	no bid

BID #15G06 - PRINTING, LETTERHEAD, ENVELOPES, RECEIPTS, ETC.

			<u>W.B. Mason</u>	<u>Village Office Supply</u>	<u>Phoenix Bus Prods</u>	<u>Gallery Digital</u>	<u>Lorraine Gregory Corp.</u>	<u>Postal Env. Co.</u>
<u>Accessory Apartment Checklist</u>								
4e.	8 1/2" x 11" 2 page NCR sets, white, pink	per 1000	\$185.00	\$135.40	\$100.00	\$110.00	no bid	no bid
<u>Certificate of Occupancy</u>								
4f.	8 1/2" x 11" NCR 2 page sets blue & pink consecutively numbered	per 1500	\$196.00	\$174.75	\$195.00	no bid	no bid	no bid
<u>Notice of Illegal Structure</u>								
4g.	8 1/2" x 11" NCR 3 page sets white, yellow, pink	per 1000	\$184.00	\$160.10	\$150.00	\$145.00	no bid	no bid
<u>Incomplete Application (plans examination)</u>								
4h.	8 1/2" x 11" NCR 2 page set white, yellow	per 1000	\$165.00	\$135.40	\$100.00	\$95.00	no bid	no bid
<u>Inspection</u>								
4i.	8 1/2" x 6" NCR 2 page sets pale green, 2nd page tag stock	per 2000	\$210.00	\$146.65	\$150.00	no bid	no bid	no bid
<u>Inspection request</u>								
4j.	8 1/2" x 6" NCR 2 page sets, white, 2nd page tag stock	per 2000	\$205.00	\$146.65	\$150.00	no bid	no bid	no bid
<u>Denial of permit</u>								
<u>Residential</u>								
4k.	8 1/2" x 14 1/2" including pref stub (stub is 1/2") NCR 2 page sets, pink, yellow	per 1000	\$170.00	\$452.65	\$110.00	no bid	no bid	no bid
<u>Commercial</u>								
4l.	8 1/2" x 14" NCR 3 page sets white, yellow, pink	per 1000	\$185.00	\$422.25	\$140.00	\$440.00	no bid	no bid
<u>Fire Marshals Office receipt books</u>								
4m.	8 1/2" x 5 1/2" NCR 3 page sets, 2 pages perforated, 1 stationery, white,yellow,pink, consecutively numbered 25 per book, covered front & back index stock, bound edge additional 3/4". Paper std #16	per 40	\$295.00	\$190.03	\$220.00	no bid	no bid	no bid
<u>Fire Marshals Office Inspection reports</u>								
4n.	8 1/2" x 11" NCR 3 page sets, 20 lb weight, 2 perforated 1 stationary, white,blue,yellow, consecutively numbered 25 perbook, cover front & back index stock, bound edges to be additional 3/4". Paper std. #16.	per 40	\$305.00	\$236.00	\$360.00	no bid	no bid	no bid

BID #15G06 - PRINTING, LETTERHEAD, ENVELOPES, RECEIPTS, ETC.

		<u>W.B. Mason</u>	<u>Village Office Supply</u>	<u>Phoenix Bus Prods</u>	<u>Gallery Digital</u>	<u>Lorraine Gregory Corp.</u>	<u>Postal Env. Co.</u>
<u>Fire Marshals Office Permit books</u>							
4o. 8 1/2" x 11" NCR 3 page sets, green,white,pink 2 pages perforated, 1 stationary, 25 per book, covered front and back index stock, bound additional 3/4", consecutively numbered. Paper std. #16.	per 40	\$325.00	\$220.15	\$240.00	no bid	no bid	no bid
<u>D.P.W. Defect Report</u>							
4p. 8 1/2" x 11" NCR 2 page sets white, blue	per 1000	\$170.00	\$135.40	\$95.00	\$250.00	no bid	no bid
<u>D.P.W. Sewer Excavation permit</u>							
4q. 8 1/2" x 11" NCR 4 page sets white,yellow,pink,gold	per 1000	\$190.00	\$172.99	\$180.00	\$580.00	no bid	no bid
<u>D.P.W. Excavation in streets permit application</u>							
4r. 8 1/2" x 14" NCR 4 page sets white, yellow, pink, gold	per 1000	\$285.00	\$207.65	\$175.00	\$580.00	no bid	no bid
<u>D.P.W. Excavation in streets permit</u>							
4s. 8 1/2" x 11" NCR 3 page sets white,yellow,blue, 2 3/4" bottom portion perforated in triplicate.Consecutively numbered tops and bottoms. 25 sets per book. Cardboard backing with 3/4" bound edge printed title & book number	per 1000	\$295.00	\$271.28	\$240.00	no bid	no bid	no bid
<u>Purchasing Requisitions</u>							
4t. 8 1/2" x 14" NCR 2 page sets pink, & white or blue & white, Consecutively numbered	per 5000	\$365.00	\$422.25	\$440.00	#####	no bid	no bid
<u>Recreation Log Books</u>							
4u. 9" x 5 1/2" NCR 3 page sets (white yellow pink), vertical perforations 1/2" from left side. Single sided print, black ink. 40 sets to a book with wraparound cardstock cover. 2 verticle staples on left. 20 diff types - each has a different title and slight variations in print	per 40	\$290.00	\$337.78	\$480.00	\$725.00	no bid	no bid
<u>Accessory Apartment, Planning Board, Zoning Board of Appeals and Town Board Signs</u>							
4x. 27" x 38" sign printed on p/s 4 mil white vinyl. Accessory Apt. blue letters, Planning Board green letters, Zoning Board of appeals red letters, Town Board black letters, peel and stick adhesive on back with slit paper liner	per 100	no bid	\$4,900.00	\$850.00	#####	no bid	no bid